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This book invites us to celebrate our strengths and work with our weaknesses by learning to identify and
utilize five basic personal styles or energies. Written in a playful and accessible way, this is the first general-
audience book on a Tibetan Buddhist system known as "the five buddha families"—an insightful way of
understanding human behavior and promoting personal growth.

Each of the five wisdom energies is associated with particular ways of perceiving and interacting with the
world and also with particular colors, elements, senses, seasons, and times of day. With easy, fun, and
engaging exercises and stories, Irini Rockwell shows us how to identify which energies are active in our
lives, and how we can work with them in any situation to improve self-awareness, communication, and
creative expression.

According to the Tibetan Buddhist tradition, each of us has one or two dominant energies, but these can shift
and change over time, and we can manifest different energies in different areas of our lives. Each of the five
energies has its unique wisdom, but also its neurotic tendencies. By learning to recognize which energies we
possess—and which are present in those around us—we can learn to relax and appreciate our natural traits
and those of others, and we can move away from our neuroses toward the wisdom-aspects of our character.
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From reader reviews:

Melvin Paul:

What do you with regards to book? It is not important along? Or just adding material when you really need
something to explain what your own problem? How about your spare time? Or are you busy person? If you
don't have spare time to accomplish others business, it is give you a sense of feeling bored faster. And you
have spare time? What did you do? Every person has many questions above. They need to answer that
question simply because just their can do that will. It said that about reserve. Book is familiar in each person.
Yes, it is suitable. Because start from on guardería until university need this particular The Five Wisdom
Energies: A Buddhist Way of Understanding Personalities, Emotions, and Relationships to read.

Billy Reynolds:

Hey guys, do you wishes to finds a new book you just read? May be the book with the concept The Five
Wisdom Energies: A Buddhist Way of Understanding Personalities, Emotions, and Relationships suitable to
you? The actual book was written by renowned writer in this era. The book untitled The Five Wisdom
Energies: A Buddhist Way of Understanding Personalities, Emotions, and Relationshipsis the one of several
books which everyone read now. This book was inspired a number of people in the world. When you read
this publication you will enter the new dimension that you ever know before. The author explained their plan
in the simple way, so all of people can easily to recognise the core of this publication. This book will give
you a great deal of information about this world now. To help you to see the represented of the world in this
particular book.

Bobby Hall:

Is it an individual who having spare time after that spend it whole day by simply watching television
programs or just laying on the bed? Do you need something totally new? This The Five Wisdom Energies: A
Buddhist Way of Understanding Personalities, Emotions, and Relationships can be the respond to, oh how
comes? It's a book you know. You are consequently out of date, spending your spare time by reading in this
fresh era is common not a nerd activity. So what these guides have than the others?

Steven Atkins:

Do you like reading a reserve? Confuse to looking for your best book? Or your book was rare? Why so many
issue for the book? But just about any people feel that they enjoy to get reading. Some people likes reading,
not only science book and also novel and The Five Wisdom Energies: A Buddhist Way of Understanding
Personalities, Emotions, and Relationships or maybe others sources were given expertise for you. After you
know how the truly amazing a book, you feel want to read more and more. Science publication was created
for teacher as well as students especially. Those textbooks are helping them to bring their knowledge. In
additional case, beside science book, any other book likes The Five Wisdom Energies: A Buddhist Way of
Understanding Personalities, Emotions, and Relationships to make your spare time a lot more colorful. Many



types of book like here.
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