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Do të thosha se, këta poetë që Arjan Kallço ka përzgjedhur për këtë antologji, vijnë natyrshëm në letërsinë
shqipe. Ata të gjithë sjellin frymë mesdhetare të poezisë italiane, e mbushur me dritën e Detit, tingujt, ngjyrat
dhe aromat e tij. Kjo përmbledhje poetike është në të njëjtën kohë e larmishme, njëlloj si fytyrat e karakteret
njerëzore që gjallojnë këtë botë mesdhetare.
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From reader reviews:

Charlotte Maas:

Here thing why this kind of Lundrim mbi valë: 15 poetë bashkë kohorë italianë (Albanian Edition) are
different and trustworthy to be yours. First of all studying a book is good however it depends in the content
of the usb ports which is the content is as yummy as food or not. Lundrim mbi valë: 15 poetë bashkë kohorë
italianë (Albanian Edition) giving you information deeper as different ways, you can find any publication out
there but there is no guide that similar with Lundrim mbi valë: 15 poetë bashkë kohorë italianë (Albanian
Edition). It gives you thrill examining journey, its open up your own personal eyes about the thing which
happened in the world which is probably can be happened around you. It is possible to bring everywhere like
in playground, café, or even in your way home by train. Should you be having difficulties in bringing the
published book maybe the form of Lundrim mbi valë: 15 poetë bashkë kohorë italianë (Albanian Edition) in
e-book can be your alternate.

Gregory Proctor:

Now a day people that Living in the era just where everything reachable by talk with the internet and the
resources inside can be true or not require people to be aware of each info they get. How people have to be
smart in receiving any information nowadays? Of course the answer then is reading a book. Reading a book
can help persons out of this uncertainty Information mainly this Lundrim mbi valë: 15 poetë bashkë kohorë
italianë (Albanian Edition) book because book offers you rich details and knowledge. Of course the
knowledge in this book hundred pct guarantees there is no doubt in it everbody knows.

Tony Partee:

The book untitled Lundrim mbi valë: 15 poetë bashkë kohorë italianë (Albanian Edition) is the reserve that
recommended to you to learn. You can see the quality of the guide content that will be shown to you. The
language that writer use to explained their ideas are easily to understand. The author was did a lot of study
when write the book, and so the information that they share to you is absolutely accurate. You also can get
the e-book of Lundrim mbi valë: 15 poetë bashkë kohorë italianë (Albanian Edition) from the publisher to
make you considerably more enjoy free time.

Jose Higham:

Don't be worry when you are afraid that this book will filled the space in your house, you may have it in e-
book approach, more simple and reachable. That Lundrim mbi valë: 15 poetë bashkë kohorë italianë
(Albanian Edition) can give you a lot of friends because by you taking a look at this one book you have point
that they don't and make you more like an interesting person. This particular book can be one of one step for
you to get success. This e-book offer you information that probably your friend doesn't recognize, by
knowing more than additional make you to be great folks. So , why hesitate? We should have Lundrim mbi
valë: 15 poetë bashkë kohorë italianë (Albanian Edition).
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