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THE CLOUD OF UNKNOWING and THE BOOK OF PRIVY COUNSELING are the first explorations in
the English language of the soul’s quest for God.
Written in Middle English by an unknown fourteenth-century mystic, THE CLOUD OF UNKNOWING
expresses with beauty a message that has inspired such great religious thinkers as St. John of the Cross and
Teilhard de Chardin, as well as countless others in search of God. Offering a practical guide to the life of
contemplation, the author explains that ordinary thoughts and earthly concepts must be buried beneath a
“cloud of forgetting,” while our love must rise toward a God hidden in the “cloud of unknowing.” THE
BOOK OF PRIVY COUNSELING, also included in this volume, is a short and moving text on the way to
enlightenment through a total loss of self and a consciousness only of the divine.

William Johnston, an authority on fourteenth-century mysticism and spirituality, provides an accessible
discussion of the works, detailing what is known about the history of the texts and their author. In a new
foreword, Huston Smith draws on his extensive knowledge of the varieties of religious experience to
illuminate the relevance of these works for contemporary readers.
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From reader reviews:

Michael Battle:

The book The Cloud of Unknowing: and The Book of Privy Counseling (Image Classics) can give more
knowledge and information about everything you want. So why must we leave a good thing like a book The
Cloud of Unknowing: and The Book of Privy Counseling (Image Classics)? A number of you have a
different opinion about reserve. But one aim which book can give many data for us. It is absolutely right.
Right now, try to closer along with your book. Knowledge or details that you take for that, it is possible to
give for each other; you may share all of these. Book The Cloud of Unknowing: and The Book of Privy
Counseling (Image Classics) has simple shape nevertheless, you know: it has great and large function for
you. You can look the enormous world by open and read a e-book. So it is very wonderful.

Rebecca Shadwick:

Reading a guide can be one of a lot of activity that everyone in the world likes. Do you like reading book
therefore. There are a lot of reasons why people fantastic. First reading a book will give you a lot of new
facts. When you read a reserve you will get new information due to the fact book is one of many ways to
share the information or their idea. Second, reading through a book will make you more imaginative. When
you examining a book especially tale fantasy book the author will bring you to definitely imagine the story
how the characters do it anything. Third, you may share your knowledge to some others. When you read this
The Cloud of Unknowing: and The Book of Privy Counseling (Image Classics), you may tells your family,
friends and also soon about yours publication. Your knowledge can inspire different ones, make them
reading a guide.

Ryan Pearson:

Playing with family in a park, coming to see the ocean world or hanging out with good friends is thing that
usually you might have done when you have spare time, subsequently why you don't try factor that really
opposite from that. 1 activity that make you not sensation tired but still relaxing, trilling like on roller coaster
you have been ride on and with addition details. Even you love The Cloud of Unknowing: and The Book of
Privy Counseling (Image Classics), you could enjoy both. It is great combination right, you still want to miss
it? What kind of hangout type is it? Oh seriously its mind hangout men. What? Still don't have it, oh come on
its referred to as reading friends.

Eric Beasley:

Do you like reading a book? Confuse to looking for your selected book? Or your book seemed to be rare?
Why so many problem for the book? But virtually any people feel that they enjoy with regard to reading.
Some people likes examining, not only science book but novel and The Cloud of Unknowing: and The Book
of Privy Counseling (Image Classics) or even others sources were given information for you. After you know
how the truly great a book, you feel wish to read more and more. Science guide was created for teacher as



well as students especially. Those guides are helping them to add their knowledge. In some other case,
beside science guide, any other book likes The Cloud of Unknowing: and The Book of Privy Counseling
(Image Classics) to make your spare time much more colorful. Many types of book like this.
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