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Erica Ryan is flying home from London after a disastrous business trip. Free spirit Abby Hayes is flying into
New York City to visit her mother before jetting off again. Both end up in Gander, Canada, when their flight
is diverted because of 9/11. For ninety-six hours they share a rollercoaster of emotions and find themselves
drawn to one another. Will their nascent connection survive everyday life when they return home?

Georgia Beers is the author of eight lesbian romances and has won the Lambda Literary Award and the
Golden Grown Literacy Award.
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From reader reviews:

Harold McDonough:

Here thing why this kind of 96 Hours are different and dependable to be yours. First of all looking at a book
is good but it depends in the content than it which is the content is as delicious as food or not. 96 Hours
giving you information deeper including different ways, you can find any publication out there but there is
no guide that similar with 96 Hours. It gives you thrill studying journey, its open up your eyes about the
thing that will happened in the world which is might be can be happened around you. You can easily bring
everywhere like in park, café, or even in your approach home by train. If you are having difficulties in
bringing the imprinted book maybe the form of 96 Hours in e-book can be your substitute.

Jennifer Mitchell:

Playing with family in a very park, coming to see the marine world or hanging out with close friends is thing
that usually you might have done when you have spare time, in that case why you don't try thing that really
opposite from that. One activity that make you not sensation tired but still relaxing, trilling like on roller
coaster you have been ride on and with addition of information. Even you love 96 Hours, you may enjoy
both. It is very good combination right, you still want to miss it? What kind of hang type is it? Oh seriously
its mind hangout men. What? Still don't understand it, oh come on its identified as reading friends.

Lashunda McCloud:

96 Hours can be one of your beginning books that are good idea. All of us recommend that straight away
because this e-book has good vocabulary that can increase your knowledge in vocab, easy to understand, bit
entertaining however delivering the information. The writer giving his/her effort that will put every word
into joy arrangement in writing 96 Hours although doesn't forget the main level, giving the reader the hottest
and based confirm resource data that maybe you can be considered one of it. This great information can
drawn you into new stage of crucial considering.

Irene Hoyt:

Do you really one of the book lovers? If so, do you ever feeling doubt if you find yourself in the book store?
Try and pick one book that you just dont know the inside because don't determine book by its protect may
doesn't work this is difficult job because you are frightened that the inside maybe not as fantastic as in the
outside seem likes. Maybe you answer is usually 96 Hours why because the excellent cover that make you
consider about the content will not disappoint you. The inside or content is usually fantastic as the outside or
maybe cover. Your reading 6th sense will directly make suggestions to pick up this book.
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