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In this charming, clever, and darkly satiric novel set at a writers’ conference, one man finds himself caught in
a whirlwind of literary pretention, a suspect in a criminal investigation, and hopelessly in love with a woman
who thinks he’s someone else.

Mistaken for a famous but reclusive author of the same name, lonely Shriver attends a writers’ conference at
a small Midwestern liberal arts college. Completely unfamiliar with the novel he supposedly wrote and
utterly unprepared for the magnitude of the reputation that precedes him, Shriver is feted, fawned over,
featured at stuffy literary panels, and barely manages to play it cool. Things quickly go awry when one of the
other guest authors suddenly disappears and Shriver becomes a prime suspect in the investigation. Amidst
eager fans, Shriver must contend with a persistent police detective, a pesky journalist determined to unearth
his past, and a mysterious and possibly dangerous stalker who seems to know his secret. But most vexing of
all, Shriver’s gone and fallen in love with the conference organizer, who believes he’s someone else.

When the “real” Shriver (or is he?) appears to claim his place among the literati, the conference—and
Shriver’s world—threaten to unravel.

Filled with witty dialogue, hilarious antics, and a cast of bizarre and endearing characters, Shriver is at once
a touching love story, a surreal examination of identity, and an affectionate tribute to the power of writing.
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From reader reviews:

James Drake:

The book Shriver: A Novel can give more knowledge and also the precise product information about
everything you want. So why must we leave the best thing like a book Shriver: A Novel? Some of you have
a different opinion about reserve. But one aim that book can give many details for us. It is absolutely correct.
Right now, try to closer along with your book. Knowledge or data that you take for that, it is possible to give
for each other; you are able to share all of these. Book Shriver: A Novel has simple shape however, you
know: it has great and big function for you. You can appearance the enormous world by start and read a
book. So it is very wonderful.

Melvin Hayes:

Do you really one of the book lovers? If so, do you ever feeling doubt if you are in the book store? Try to
pick one book that you find out the inside because don't evaluate book by its handle may doesn't work the
following is difficult job because you are scared that the inside maybe not seeing that fantastic as in the
outside appear likes. Maybe you answer can be Shriver: A Novel why because the excellent cover that make
you consider regarding the content will not disappoint anyone. The inside or content is fantastic as the
outside or even cover. Your reading 6th sense will directly assist you to pick up this book.

Joan Naylor:

This Shriver: A Novel is great reserve for you because the content that is full of information for you who else
always deal with world and have to make decision every minute. This specific book reveal it data accurately
using great manage word or we can point out no rambling sentences in it. So if you are read that hurriedly
you can have whole data in it. Doesn't mean it only will give you straight forward sentences but hard core
information with wonderful delivering sentences. Having Shriver: A Novel in your hand like obtaining the
world in your arm, details in it is not ridiculous one particular. We can say that no book that offer you world
with ten or fifteen tiny right but this book already do that. So , it is good reading book. Heya Mr. and Mrs.
stressful do you still doubt in which?

Walter Dion:

In this particular era which is the greater individual or who has ability in doing something more are more
valuable than other. Do you want to become one of it? It is just simple way to have that. What you have to do
is just spending your time very little but quite enough to experience a look at some books. One of the books
in the top list in your reading list is usually Shriver: A Novel. This book which can be qualified as The
Hungry Mountains can get you closer in becoming precious person. By looking way up and review this e-
book you can get many advantages.
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