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GET THE 900 MOST FREQUENTLY TESTED GRE WORDS AND RAISE YOUR SCORE!  
 
REA’s GRE Vocabulary Flashcards - Complete Prep For GRE Vocabulary  
 
REA’s GRE Vocabulary Flashcard Book offers students and professionals a great way to prepare for the
Verbal Ability and Analytical Writing sections of the GRE General exam. Based on the most frequently
tested words on the GRE Verbal section, our flashcard book contains 900 must-study vocabulary terms with
definitions.   
 
900 Must-Know Words For Total Preparation 
Get the 900 most frequently tested words on the GRE Verbal section. Each word is identified by its part of
speech, comes with a concise definition, and is used in context in a sentence. Taken from actual GRE exams,
our vocabulary list familiarizes you with the types of words that appear consistently on the GRE.   
 
Perfect for Self Study and Quick Review 
REA’s flashcards allow you to test yourself and study at your own pace. Write your definition of a word in
the space provided, then flip the page to compare your definition to the correct one. The comprehensive
index makes it easy to look up words for additional study.  
 
Convenient Book Format  
Our flashcards are bound in a handy book that makes studying easy. This convenient, portable format lets
you take the book with you and study anywhere—without worrying about hundreds of loose cards.   
 
Maximize Your Study Time with our iPhone® App!
Our unique vocabulary app offers instant test prep wherever you go. It works with either your Apple
iPhone® or iPod touch®.
 
GRE experts agree that building a powerful GRE-specific vocabulary is an excellent way to raise your score
on the Verbal and Writing sections of the exam. So get the 900 most frequently tested GRE words and raise
your score!   
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From reader reviews:

David Chambers:

Book is to be different per grade. Book for children until finally adult are different content. As you may
know that book is very important for us. The book GRE Vocabulary Flashcard Book (GRE Test Preparation)
seemed to be making you to know about other know-how and of course you can take more information. It is
quite advantages for you. The reserve GRE Vocabulary Flashcard Book (GRE Test Preparation) is not only
giving you far more new information but also being your friend when you experience bored. You can spend
your personal spend time to read your publication. Try to make relationship using the book GRE Vocabulary
Flashcard Book (GRE Test Preparation). You never really feel lose out for everything should you read some
books.

Eugene Glover:

Do you one of people who can't read enjoyable if the sentence chained in the straightway, hold on guys this
specific aren't like that. This GRE Vocabulary Flashcard Book (GRE Test Preparation) book is readable by
simply you who hate the perfect word style. You will find the data here are arrange for enjoyable reading
experience without leaving perhaps decrease the knowledge that want to deliver to you. The writer of GRE
Vocabulary Flashcard Book (GRE Test Preparation) content conveys the idea easily to understand by lots of
people. The printed and e-book are not different in the articles but it just different as it. So , do you still
thinking GRE Vocabulary Flashcard Book (GRE Test Preparation) is not loveable to be your top checklist
reading book?

Matthew Williams:

The reserve untitled GRE Vocabulary Flashcard Book (GRE Test Preparation) is the e-book that
recommended to you you just read. You can see the quality of the guide content that will be shown to you
actually. The language that creator use to explained their ideas are easily to understand. The article author
was did a lot of analysis when write the book, and so the information that they share to you is absolutely
accurate. You also could possibly get the e-book of GRE Vocabulary Flashcard Book (GRE Test
Preparation) from the publisher to make you far more enjoy free time.

Maria Davis:

A lot of people said that they feel weary when they reading a book. They are directly felt this when they get a
half regions of the book. You can choose the particular book GRE Vocabulary Flashcard Book (GRE Test
Preparation) to make your reading is interesting. Your own personal skill of reading ability is developing
when you just like reading. Try to choose simple book to make you enjoy to study it and mingle the
impression about book and reading through especially. It is to be 1st opinion for you to like to open up a
book and read it. Beside that the book GRE Vocabulary Flashcard Book (GRE Test Preparation) can to be
your brand-new friend when you're sense alone and confuse with the information must you're doing of that



time.
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