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This introduction to quantum algorithms is concise but comprehensive, covering many key algorithms. It is
mathematically rigorous but requires minimal background and assumes no knowledge of quantum theory or
quantum mechanics. The book explains quantum computation in terms of elementary linear algebra; it
assumes the reader will have some familiarity with vectors, matrices, and their basic properties, but offers a
review of all the relevant material from linear algebra. By emphasizing computation and algorithms rather
than physics, this primer makes quantum algorithms accessible to students and researchers in computer
science without the complications of quantum mechanical notation, physical concepts, and philosophical
issues.After explaining the development of quantum operations and computations based on linear algebra,
the book presents the major quantum algorithms, from seminal algorithms by Deutsch, Jozsa, and Simon
through Shor's and Grover's algorithms to recent quantum walks. It covers quantum gates, computational
complexity, and some graph theory. Mathematical proofs are generally short and straightforward; quantum
circuits and gates are used to illuminate linear algebra; and the discussion of complexity is anchored in
computational problems rather than machine models. Quantum Algorithms via Linear Algebra is suitable for
classroom use or as a reference for computer scientists and mathematicians.
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From reader reviews:

Virginia Smith:

The book Quantum Algorithms via Linear Algebra: A Primer (MIT Press) can give more knowledge and
information about everything you want. Exactly why must we leave the best thing like a book Quantum
Algorithms via Linear Algebra: A Primer (MIT Press)? Several of you have a different opinion about book.
But one aim in which book can give many facts for us. It is absolutely appropriate. Right now, try to closer
along with your book. Knowledge or info that you take for that, you are able to give for each other; it is
possible to share all of these. Book Quantum Algorithms via Linear Algebra: A Primer (MIT Press) has
simple shape but you know: it has great and massive function for you. You can search the enormous world
by open and read a book. So it is very wonderful.

Steven Thomas:

Nowadays reading books are more than want or need but also turn into a life style. This reading addiction
give you lot of advantages. The benefits you got of course the knowledge even the information inside the
book that will improve your knowledge and information. The knowledge you get based on what kind of
publication you read, if you want drive more knowledge just go with schooling books but if you want feel
happy read one along with theme for entertaining for instance comic or novel. The actual Quantum
Algorithms via Linear Algebra: A Primer (MIT Press) is kind of reserve which is giving the reader erratic
experience.

Bernice Cofield:

Don't be worry should you be afraid that this book will probably filled the space in your house, you could
have it in e-book approach, more simple and reachable. That Quantum Algorithms via Linear Algebra: A
Primer (MIT Press) can give you a lot of buddies because by you checking out this one book you have issue
that they don't and make you actually more like an interesting person. This book can be one of one step for
you to get success. This e-book offer you information that perhaps your friend doesn't learn, by knowing
more than other make you to be great individuals. So , why hesitate? Let me have Quantum Algorithms via
Linear Algebra: A Primer (MIT Press).

Louella Rape:

A lot of guide has printed but it is different. You can get it by world wide web on social media. You can
choose the best book for you, science, comic, novel, or whatever by simply searching from it. It is referred to
as of book Quantum Algorithms via Linear Algebra: A Primer (MIT Press). You can include your
knowledge by it. Without departing the printed book, it may add your knowledge and make anyone happier
to read. It is most crucial that, you must aware about publication. It can bring you from one destination for a
other place.
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