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In his brilliant interdisciplinary analysis of the global financial crisis, Joseph Vogl aims to demystify finance
capitalism—with its bewildering array of new instruments—by tracing the historical stages through which
the financial market achieved its current autonomy. Classical and neoclassical economic theorists have
played a decisive role here. Ignoring early warnings about the instability of speculative finance markets, they
have persisted in their belief in the inherent equilibrium of the market, describing even major crises as mere
aberrations or adjustments and rationalizing dubious financial practices that escalate risk while seeking to
manage it.

"The market knows best": this is a secular version of Adam Smith's faith in the market's "invisible hand," his
economic interpretation of eighteenth-century providentialist theodicy, which subsequently hardened into an
"oikodicy," an unquestioning belief in the self-regulating beneficence of market forces. Vogl shows that
financial theory, assisted by mathematical modeling and digital technology, itself operates as a "hidden
hand," pushing economic reality into unknown territory. He challenges economic theorists to move beyond
the neoclassical paradigm to discern the true contours of the current epoch of financial convulsions.
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From reader reviews:

Pauline Jefferson:

Book is to be different for every single grade. Book for children till adult are different content. As we know
that book is very important for people. The book The Specter of Capital (Cultural Memory in the Present)
ended up being making you to know about other knowledge and of course you can take more information. It
is quite advantages for you. The guide The Specter of Capital (Cultural Memory in the Present) is not only
giving you far more new information but also to get your friend when you experience bored. You can spend
your own personal spend time to read your publication. Try to make relationship while using book The
Specter of Capital (Cultural Memory in the Present). You never feel lose out for everything should you read
some books.

Deana Broom:

Information is provisions for those to get better life, information currently can get by anyone with
everywhere. The information can be a knowledge or any news even an issue. What people must be consider
whenever those information which is within the former life are hard to be find than now is taking seriously
which one is acceptable to believe or which one the particular resource are convinced. If you get the unstable
resource then you obtain it as your main information you will have huge disadvantage for you. All of those
possibilities will not happen throughout you if you take The Specter of Capital (Cultural Memory in the
Present) as your daily resource information.

Richard Shumate:

This book untitled The Specter of Capital (Cultural Memory in the Present) to be one of several books this
best seller in this year, that is because when you read this e-book you can get a lot of benefit onto it. You will
easily to buy that book in the book shop or you can order it through online. The publisher with this book sells
the e-book too. It makes you quicker to read this book, as you can read this book in your Mobile phone. So
there is no reason to you personally to past this reserve from your list.

Effie Morris:

Beside this specific The Specter of Capital (Cultural Memory in the Present) in your phone, it might give you
a way to get closer to the new knowledge or details. The information and the knowledge you can got here is
fresh from your oven so don't possibly be worry if you feel like an previous people live in narrow
community. It is good thing to have The Specter of Capital (Cultural Memory in the Present) because this
book offers to your account readable information. Do you at times have book but you rarely get what it's
exactly about. Oh come on, that would not happen if you have this in the hand. The Enjoyable option here
cannot be questionable, such as treasuring beautiful island. Techniques you still want to miss this? Find this
book and read it from now!
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