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Knowledge Cities

Knowledge Cities
Knowledge Cities are cities that possess an economy driven by high value-added exports created through
research, technology, and brainpower. In other words, these are cities in which both the private and the
public sectors value knowledge, nurture knowledge, spend money on supporting knowledge dissemination
and discovery (ie learning and innovation) and harness knowledge to create products and services that add
value and create wealth. Currently there are 65 urban development programs worldwide formally designated
as “knowledge cities.” Knowledge-based cities fall under a new area of academic research entitled
Knowledge-Based Development, which brings together research in urban development and urban studies and
planning with knowledge management and intellectual capital.

In this book, Francisco Javier Carillo of the Monterrey Institute of Technology (ITESM) brings together a
group of distinguished scholars to outline the theory, development, and realities of knowledge cities. Based
on knowledge-based development, the book shows how knowledge can be and is placed at the center of city
planning and economic development to enable knowledge flows and innovation to provide a sustainable
environment for high value-added products and services.
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From reader reviews:

Benjamin Deloatch:

The book Knowledge Cities gives you the sense of being enjoy for your spare time. You may use to make
your capable far more increase. Book can to get your best friend when you getting strain or having big
problem using your subject. If you can make reading a book Knowledge Cities to become your habit, you
can get more advantages, like add your personal capable, increase your knowledge about many or all
subjects. It is possible to know everything if you like open up and read a guide Knowledge Cities. Kinds of
book are a lot of. It means that, science publication or encyclopedia or others. So , how do you think about
this publication?

Mark Whitten:

Here thing why this particular Knowledge Cities are different and trusted to be yours. First of all examining a
book is good nevertheless it depends in the content of the usb ports which is the content is as tasty as food or
not. Knowledge Cities giving you information deeper including different ways, you can find any e-book out
there but there is no reserve that similar with Knowledge Cities. It gives you thrill reading through journey,
its open up your own personal eyes about the thing in which happened in the world which is might be can be
happened around you. You can actually bring everywhere like in park, café, or even in your means home by
train. For anyone who is having difficulties in bringing the published book maybe the form of Knowledge
Cities in e-book can be your option.

James Longo:

The actual book Knowledge Cities has a lot of information on it. So when you make sure to read this book
you can get a lot of advantage. The book was written by the very famous author. Tom makes some research
before write this book. This particular book very easy to read you can find the point easily after reading this
article book.

Robert Oshea:

Don't be worry should you be afraid that this book will certainly filled the space in your house, you could
have it in e-book way, more simple and reachable. This specific Knowledge Cities can give you a lot of
buddies because by you considering this one book you have thing that they don't and make a person more
like an interesting person. This particular book can be one of a step for you to get success. This guide offer
you information that possibly your friend doesn't understand, by knowing more than some other make you to
be great folks. So , why hesitate? Let me have Knowledge Cities.
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