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From a pioneer of modern U.S. Hispanic literature, and the New York Times bestselling author of
Crazy Loco Love and Rain of Gold, comes a gripping, coming-of-age tale that exposes the intensity and
sheer will of one brave young immigrant who crosses the Mexican border.

Roberto Garcia is only seventeen, but he already has big dreams of making his fortune, building a family,
and gaining the respect of his community. With ambition to burn and a passion to prove his manhood,
Roberto takes the dangerous journey north, crossing the Mexican border to pick fruit in the “golden fields”
of California. It is said that a good man can make more money there in a week than in an entire year in the
mountains of Michoacán, his home. With dreams that overshadow harsh realities, Roberto is unprepared for
the jammed boxcars and bolted trucks that carry undervalued migrant workers through the searing desert to
long days of harsh labor.

Raw, powerful, poetic, and heartbreaking, Macho! brings to life the brutality of migrant labor, Cesar
Chavez’s efforts to unionize workers, and a vivid portrayal of the immigrant experience through the eyes of a
brave young man who bids goodbye to everything he knows to follow his dreams.
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From reader reviews:

Todd Jacobs:

What do you about book? It is not important along with you? Or just adding material when you need
something to explain what your own problem? How about your spare time? Or are you busy man or woman?
If you don't have spare time to accomplish others business, it is make one feel bored faster. And you have
extra time? What did you do? Every person has many questions above. They have to answer that question
since just their can do this. It said that about publication. Book is familiar in each person. Yes, it is suitable.
Because start from on guardería until university need this Macho!: A Novel to read.

John Lee:

As people who live in the modest era should be update about what going on or information even knowledge
to make these people keep up with the era that is certainly always change and progress. Some of you maybe
can update themselves by studying books. It is a good choice for yourself but the problems coming to you is
you don't know which you should start with. This Macho!: A Novel is our recommendation so you keep up
with the world. Why, because this book serves what you want and need in this era.

Marjorie Cook:

Playing with family within a park, coming to see the water world or hanging out with buddies is thing that
usually you could have done when you have spare time, subsequently why you don't try point that really
opposite from that. Just one activity that make you not experiencing tired but still relaxing, trilling like on
roller coaster you are ride on and with addition associated with. Even you love Macho!: A Novel, you are
able to enjoy both. It is excellent combination right, you still wish to miss it? What kind of hang-out type is
it? Oh occur its mind hangout men. What? Still don't get it, oh come on its identified as reading friends.

Brandy Brobst:

Some people said that they feel weary when they reading a reserve. They are directly felt the idea when they
get a half regions of the book. You can choose typically the book Macho!: A Novel to make your personal
reading is interesting. Your own skill of reading ability is developing when you like reading. Try to choose
very simple book to make you enjoy to see it and mingle the opinion about book and reading especially. It is
to be very first opinion for you to like to open up a book and examine it. Beside that the reserve Macho!: A
Novel can to be your new friend when you're sense alone and confuse with the information must you're
doing of the time.
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